COAL CITY
VILLAGE BOARD MEETING

WEDNESDAY
JANUARY 10, 2024
7:00 P.M.

AGENDA

. Call meeting to order

. Pledge of Allegiance

. Approval of Minutes December 13, 2023
. Approval of Warrant List

. Public Comment

. Appointment of Sergeant Michael imhof

. Appointment of Treasurer Leann Vota

. Ordinance 24-01 Rear Yard Setback Variance at 910 Jesse Court




9. Authorization for Mayor Spesia to enter into a contract with ComEd for power
supply improvement at the Water Treatment Plant

10. Approval of Water Main Replacement Project Bid

1

=

. Report of Mayor

12. Report of Trustees: B. Mincey
S. Beach
T. Bradley
P. Noffsinger
D. Greggain
D. Togliatti

13. Report of Village Clerk

14, Report of Village Attorney

15. Report of Village Engineer

16. Report of Chief of Police

17. Report of Village Administrator

18. Adjourn

Coal City Village Hall
515 S. Broadway, Coal City, IL 60416




CoAL Crry PorLice DEPARTMENT

545 S. Broadway St. * Coal City, Illinois 60416 ¢ TEL: 815-634-2341/8533 » FAX: 815-634-4383
Christopher R. Harseim, Chief of Police

January 5, 2024

To: Mayor Spesia and the Village Board

Please accept my recommendation of Michael T. Imhof as the
department’s next patrol officer who is prepared to be appointed
to the rank of Sergeant. Due to the Board of Fire and Police
Commissioners establishment of a Sergeants Eligibility List on
December 18, 2023 and in following the method for selection of a
Sergeant candidate according to 65 ILCS 5/10-2.1-15, Mr. Imhof
should be selected from the officers within the Coal City Police
Department at this time.

Chief of Police




MEMO
TO: Mayor Spesia and the Board of Trustees

FROM: Matthew T. Fritz
Village Administrator

MEETING
DATE: January 10, 2024
RE: APPOINTMENT OF THE VILLAGE TREASURER

Due to some recent retirements within village hall some restructuring occurred and the position
of Treasurer has remained open since the beginning of this fiscal year. Mayor Spesia has found
Leanne Vota, a resident of Coal City whe would like to serve and be appointed in this capacity.
This appointment shall run along with the fiscal year with the current one ending on April 30,
2024.

ILeanne graduated from the University of St. Francis with a Bachelor of Arts in Mathematics with
an actuarial science concentration and prides herself on her analytical skills, great attention to
detail, and ability to surmount challenges.

Recommendation:

Confirm Mayor Spesia’s candidate, Leanne Vota for Village Treasurer.

Mfeitz\interdepartmental\BOT\Appointmnet recommendation of Leanne Vota to Treasurer, 2024




MEMO
TO: Mayor Spesia and the Board of Trustees

FROM: Matthew T. Fritz
Village Administrator

MEETING
DATE: January 10, 2024

RE: GRANTING A VARIANCE AT 910 E. JESSE COURT FOR THE
PLACEMENT OF A FENCE WITHIN THE REAR YARD SETBACK

Chris Collier, the owner of a residence on the north side of the cul de sac at Jesse Court in
Meadow Estates that is a through lot, would like a newly installed fence along Richards to
possess a setback of 12°6” from the rear boundary of the property as opposed to the 25” setback
requirement. A detached garage was properly constructed within the required setback
previously, but the homeowner would like to fence in more of his rear yard by placing the fence
closer to Richards and fencing the detached garage within the fenced in yard as well. To do so
requires a variance from the prescribed rear yard setbacks contained within the code.

No one aside from the petitioner appeared at the public hearing in regards to speaking on the
matter of granting the variance. The members of the Zoning Board of Appeals unanimously
voted to positively recommend the request to the Board of Trustees for adoption.

Recommendation:

Adopt Ordinance No. : Granting a Rear Yard Setback at 910 E. Jesse Court for the
Placement of a Fence along Richards Street.

Mfritz\planning and zoning\ Recommendation for Collier Rear Yard Setback Variance at 310 E Jesse Court




THE VILLAGE OF COAL CITY

GRUNDY & WILL COUNTIES, ILLINOIS

ORDINANCE
NUMBER

AN ORDINANCE GRANTING A VARIANCE TO THE ZONING CODE FOR THE
LOCATION OF A FENCE WITHIN THE REAR YARD SETBACK AT 910 E. JESSE
COURT IN THE VILLAGE OF COAL CITY

DAVID SPESIA, President
ALEXIS STONE, Village Clerk

SARAH BEACH
TIM BRADLEY
DAN GREGGAIN
BILL MINCEY
PAMELA M. NOFFSINGER
DAVID TOGLIATTI
Village Trustees

Published in pamphiet form by authority of the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Coal City
on , 2024

Miritz\planning and zoning board\ Ordinance for Collier Fence Variance to the BOT, 910 E Jesse Court




ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE GRANTING A VARIANCE TO THE ZONING CODE FOR THE
LOCATION OF A FENCE WITHIN THE REAR YARD SETBACK AT 910 E. JESSE
COURT IN THE VILLAGE OF COAL CITY

WHEREAS, an application for variance from Section 156.73 of the Village of Coal City
Zoning Code (“Zoning Code”) was filed by Chris Collier (“applicant”) on November 20, 2023 for
the placement of a 6” high cedar fence; and

WHEREAS, Section 156.73 requires adherence to the minimum rear yard setback
provided within Table 4 of 25 feet; and

WHEREAS, a public hearing was noticed and duly held on January 2, 2024; and

WHEREAS, the Village of Coal City Planning and Zoning Board met on January 2, 2024,
and considered passage of the variance request to the Board of Trustees; and

WHEREAS, Section 156.250 permits the Village Board to approve variations from the
Zoning Code; and

WHEREAS, the Village Board of Trustees and the President of the Village of Coal City
believe it is in the best interests of the Village to grant the requested variances.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Coal City, Grundy and Will Counties, 1llinois, as follows:

Section 1. Regitals. The foregoing recitals shall be and are hereby incorporated into
and made a part of this Ordinance as if fully set forth in this Section 1.

Section 2. Findings of Fact. The Board of Trustees find as follows concerning the
Variance for 910 E. Jesse Court:

A. Special Circumstances Not Found Elsewhere. The petitioner’s yard contains a
through lot at 910 E. Jesse Court resulting in a portion of eth rear yard aligning with
the front yards of adjacent residence along Richards Road.

B. Consistent with Rights Conferred by the District. This variance is necessary to

preserve a substantial property right possessed by other properties within the same
zoning district.

Mfritz\planiing and zoning board\ Ordinance for Collier Fence Variance to the BOT, 910 E Jesse Court




C. Necessary for Use of the Property. Failure to adopt the petitioner’s variance
request shall deprive the applicant the use of the property in a manner equivalent
to the use permitted by other owners of property in a manner equivalent to the use
permitted by other owners of property in the immediate area.

D. Minimum Variance Recommended. The requested variance shall maintain a
12.5* setback from eth rear boundary line rather than placing the fence in a manner
that would place the entirety of the rear yard within the fence improvement.

Section 3. Description of the Property. The property is located at 910 E. Jesse Court
in the Village of Coal City within an RS-3 District.

Section 4. Public Hearing. A public hearing was advertised on December 6, 2023 in
the Coal City Courant and held by the Planning and Zoning Board on January 2, 2024, at which
time a majority of the Planning and Zoning Board members recommended passage of the Variance
to the Board of Trustees.

Section 5. Variances. The variations requested in the November 20, 2023 Variance
Application to the Zoning Code is granted to allow a 12.5” setback within the rear yard for the
construction of a 6” high cedar fence to be placed within the rear yard.

Section 6. Conditions. The variance granted herein is contingent and subject to the its
construction being consistent with the presentation to the Planning & Zoning Board and the Board
of Trustees.

Section 7. Severability. In the event a court of competent jurisdiction finds this
ordinance or any provision hereof to be invalid or unenforceable as applied, such finding shall not
affect the validity of the remaining provisions of this ordinance and the application thereof to the
greatest extent permitted by law.

Mfritz\planning and zoning boardt Ordinance for Collier Fence Variance to the BOT, 910 E Jesse Court




AN ORPINANCE GRANTING A VARIANCE TO THE ZONING CODE FOR THE LOCATION OF A
FENCE WITHIN THE REAR YARD SETBACK AT 910 E. JESSE COURT IN
THE VILLAGE OF COAL CITY

Section 8. Repeal and Savings Clause. All ordinances or parts of ordinances in
conflict herewith are hereby repealed; provided, however, that nothing herein contained shall
affect any rights, actions, or causes of action which shall have accrued to the Village of Coal City
prior to the effective date of this ordinance.

Section 9. Effectiveness. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and
after passage, approval and publication in pamphlet form as provided by law.

SO ORDAINED this day of , 2024, at Coal City,
Grundy & Will Counties, Illinois.

AYES:

NAYS:

ABSENT:

ABSTAIN:
VILLAGE OF COAL CITY

David A. Spesia, President

Attest:

Alexis Stone, Clerk

Mfritz\planning and zoning board\ Ordinance for Collier Fence Variance to the BOT, 910 E Jesse Court




FINAL PLAT OF SURVEY
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: / \ NORTH, RANGE B EAST OF THE THIRD PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, ACCORDING TO THE FM& ¢

PLAT THEREOF RECORDED JULY 13, 2021 IN PLAT CABINET 1, SLIDE 86, AS
DOCUMENT NO. 605403, IN GRUNDY COUNTY, ILLINOIS,
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.. COAL CITY ZONING APPLICATION

Owners name or beneficiary of land trust: ﬂ /g .v'—*l 4 & { / { ‘e,f

Address: C/ 1/ é ’r@és e T" Phone number: 5\7 /S - ‘7% = (/;‘3 c,(“)

Conl Ty
Owner represented by Self \/ Attorney
Contract purchaser Other agent
Agents name Phone number:

Address:

Existing zoning; B;S 3 Use of surrounding propertics: North Dﬁ;’l South__ QS‘“:B
Bast ng west KE=3 /VW.L___t)-

Wit soning change o varisce: pesity A\EATTNE D 126" 000 Fho featl
Clonk- yaw feveask of a Hhwugh Lot

To allow what use q I’ 6}\6-9

Tax number of subject property: ch -OQ ‘2 SS “DB

Common address of property: QI/D E Jagg@

pascet aimensions: 00 Chatpe HRIOUGH Lot wen o 200U 16500
Streetfrontagel (971:-4‘ {O-p RIC)/la[)’( 70H

Legal description A €LYV EGLte Sutn)al/xﬁ{t)lf\ Phase b lot 7—(‘)
e bQSYDR  Sectioh V32—




Tn addition, the applicant must coraply with the ZONING ORDINANCE OF THE VILLAGE OF
COAL CITY, adopted June 1, 1989, Chapter I, sections A throngh F available for review at the Village

Clerks office. Also attached to the application are tables 1, 2 and 3 for the applicant’s reference.
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1, (we) certify that afl of the above statements and the statements contained in any papers or plans

submitted herewith are true to the best of my (our) knowledge and belief.

Mﬂr < 4 / /; [l , being first duly sworn, on cath deposes and 38y3,

Apiolicant’s Name

that all of the above statements and the statements contained in the docurnents submitted herewith are

true.
Subscribed and sworn before me on this ;O day of Novendaep— L 20 _;) %
ML ot —aa
4 ~ OFFICIAL SEAL ]
; . CMCKEEFERY ) .
Notary Public (Seal) & yoragy puBLIC - STATE OF LLiNotS . } iggaiue of Ogner,,
My Commission Expires 2/16/2025 ) >
ek o e e b e el o feofodeskok " e swapiesimimtenmeic ol s o5 5 o AeslesE i sk RodskoR R R R F R AR ek R ek hieloidok
“You may attach additional pages, if needed, to support the documentation of application.
Please note the number of pages attached, \
FOR OFFICE USE ONLY

Case number Z Q - 5j D : . Location of hearing

Filing dato \ \_QQ=Q5 Village Hail

Hearing date \ e a - a\-—\ ' 515 South Bfoadway

Filing fee s\ 00 Coal City, Illinois

Hearing time . E’I ? YY)




MEMO
TO: Mayor Spesia and the Board of Trustees

FROM: Matthew T. Fritz
Village Administrator

MEETING
DATE: January 10, 2024
RE: NEW ELECTRICAL UTILITY DROP FOR THE EXPANDED WATER
TREATMENT CAPACITY

D Construction, who is the general contractor for the water treatment plant expansion project has
been working with staff on the improvements to take place in the upcoming year on this
approved construction project. A specific improvement to the plan design involves entering info
contract with ComEd to get its service drop run underground from the existing pole line along
the west side of N. Broadway underground the roadway and onto the Public Works property into
a designated pad alongside the future expanded building space.

Adding this improvement to the project will ensure there is not a simple overhead supply drop
from the existing pole and ensure that ComEd is responsible for its power supply all of the way
from the neighborhood transmission lines to the water treatment plant. This improvement comes
along with an upfront cost of $5,089.05 to complete the necessary work and ComEd enters into
the transaction via an agreement which must be endorsed by Mayor Spesia.

This expense can go into the overall planned expenditure for which the village is utilizing [EPA
low interest loans to provide the upfront funding to pay for this expansion and its necessary
costs.

Recommendation:

Authorize Mayor Spesia to enter into a Customer Work Agreement with ComEd to provide the
necessary utility power supply drop to Coal City Public Works.

Mfritz\interdepartmental\PW\2022 Water Treatment Plant Expansion\ComEd undergroudn electrical drop customer work agreement recommendation




JOLIET OFFICE e =
1910 SOUTH BRIGGS STREET 3 comed
JOLIET, ILLINOIS 60433 AN EXELON COMPANY
585-278-7790

VILLAGE OF COAL CITY Date: 11/27/2023
515 S BROADWAY ST
COAL CITY, IL 60416

For Electrical Service To:
830 N BROADWAY ST, WATER PLANT
COAL CITY, IL

Enclosed please find a copy of your Customer Work Agreement.
To ensure prompt processing of your agreement please do the following :

Review, sign and date the Customer Work Agreement.
Return the signed copy of the agreement and payment of $5,089.05 in the enclosed envelope, to
my attention.

Work cannot proceed untii we have received the signed document with your remittance and a call to
1-866-NEW-ELEC (1-866-639-3532) letting us know your electrician has completed work and passed
required municipal government inspections. Upon approval by our Company, one copy of the document
will be returned to you for your records.

If this contract is not returned within 30 days, it will be cancelled.
You may make payments on the ComEd website or by phone.
By Internet go to: <https://www.comed.com/MyAccount/MyBillUsage/Pages/PayMyBill.aspx>
(for payments of $5,000 or less for Credit/Debit)

(for non-business payments of $100,000 or less for eCheck)
(for business payments of $500,000 or less for eCheck)

Or

By Customer Service Representatives (English & Spanish)
1-800-334-7661 (for payments of $5,000 or less for Credit/Debit)
1-800-588-9477 (for non-business payments of $100,000 or less for eCheck)
1-877-426-6331 (for business payments of $500,000 or less for eCheck

If you have any questions concerning this contract please contact your Field Representative.

Sincerely,

Enclosures ALLAN GOMEZ
ENGINEERING DESIGN TECH
585-278-7790



CUSTOMER WORK AGREEMENT

' PL#: 532342 CWAH: $J230856 R:0000
Date: 11/27/2023

VILLAGE OF COAL CITY ("Customer') and ComEd ("Company”) agree that the Company will furnish at the Cuslomers expense
the labor and materials necessary to do the work for the Customer on or adjacent to the Customers premises at 830 N
BROADWAY ST, WATER PLANT, COAL CITY, IL 60416, described below.

CUSTOMER WORK AGREEMENT - CUSTOMER WORK ORDER

ADVANCED DEPOSIT $5,089.056
TOTAL CUSTOMER CHARGE $6,089.05

The Customer agrees to pay to the Company the sum of $5,089.05, payment in full due prior to beginning of Company work.

The charges listed in this contract are for performing the work identified herein under normal field conditions. I abnormal fleld
conditions are encountered and additional labor and materials are required to complete the work, or if the scope of work is
altered, ComEd reserves the right to collect, and the owner agrees to pay, additional money to cover the increased costs.

The sketch, if any, altached hereto is hereby made a parl of this Agreement and expressly designates ownership of the facilities
refered to.

The Total Customer Charge reflects the scope of work described in this Customier Work Agreement that will be performed by the
Company. This does not include charges for the relocation or removal of equipment owned by others, such as cable television
or communication companies, thal are attached to the Company's poles. It is the Gustomer's responsibility to contact these
other companies to schedule the relocation or removal of thelr equipment from the poles. These companies will bill _the
Customer senarately for the work they must perform,

Work will be done during the Company's regular working hours, unless otherwise specified.

This Agresment shall be void if not accepted by the Customer within thirly days from date submited.

Transformers and metering equipment installed in conjunction with this work, shail in all cases, remain the property of the
Company.

in the event the work covered by this Agreement cannot be completed within one year from the above date as a result of delays
on the parl of the Customer or because the Company has been denied access to the premises, the charge to the Customer
shall be recomputed based on the level of costs prevailing at the time of compietion of the work as stipulated in the Company's
General Company Order No, 25,

This agreement is subject to the provisions of the Company's Schedule of Rates and Information and Requirements for Electric
Services as on file with the llinois Commerce Commision.

FOR THE COMPANY": FOR APPLICANT:

ALLAN GOMEZ

Submitted By Accepted By Signature
Accepted By Signature Print Name

Print Name Official Capacity

Account Number: 2208014048
Work Task Number: 1916916001
Payment Stamp
Mail Bifls To:  VILLAGE OF CQAL CITY
515 § BROADWAY ST
COAL CITY, |.. 60418




_/\ ;\ comed” Agreement Date : 11/27/2023
AN EXBLORCOMBANY Phone Number : 585-278-7790
Tvpe of Payment Check L

Name : VILLAGE OF COAL CITY
Service Address : 830 N BROADWAY ST, WATER
Citv. State PLANT

Submitted by : ALLAN GOMEZ

Group :

CWA Payment

C.W.A. #: 5J230856

CIMS Account #

Work Order Task #

Total

2208014048

1916916001

$5,089.05




MEMO
TO: Mayor Spesia and the Boartd of Trustees

FROM: Matthew T. Fritz
Village Administrator

MEETING
DATE: January 10, 2024
RE: AWARDING THE WATER MAIN REPLACEMENT PROJECT TO
BRANDT EXCAVATING

Attached is the recommendation to have Brandt Excavating, Inc. complete the water main
replacement project that will utilize ARP funds to replace key infrastructure that has been in
need of replacement for a long period of time. The purpose of this project is to replace old
portions of water main that have repeatedly leaked and been repaired over the last 10-15 years
with current day water main. These portions will complete portions of the neighborhood
infrastructure that had not been previously replaced and ensure greater reliability for Coal City
residents.

Please note, although the current estimate for this project is $403,488.11, it is expected that one
more portion will be added due to the village having been selected for lead service repair; this
upcoming project will afford the opportunity to abandon one more portion of water main along
the east side of S. Broadway to complete some additional work at the time the Spring Road
portion is being completed.

At this time, please accept the bids as presented, but know that Chamlin will begin to work with
Brandt Excavating in order to utilize the unit bid prices to add an additional crossing to S.
Broadway. This additional work would be completed with a future change order.

Recommendation:

Award the 2024 Water Main Replacement Project to Brandt Excavating, Inc. at the lowest
responsive bid cost of $403,488.11.

Miritz\interdepartmentaiiengineeringy2024 Water main Project Award Receommendation for Brandt




Chamlin & Associatas
ENGINEERS » SURVEYORS « PLANNERS

MEMORANDUM
DATE: January 4, 2024
TO: Mayor David Spesia
Village of Coal City

515 South Broadway
Coal City, IL 60416

FROM: Ryan E. Hansen

SUBJECT: Village of Coal City
Carbon, Elm & Spring Water Main

221 West Washington Street « Morls, 1L 60450
Phone 815.942.1402 « Fax 815.942.1471
morris@chamlin.com » www.chamlin.com

Bids were received and were publicly opened and read today for the
Carbon, Elm & Spring Water Main, All bids received met the intent of
the proposal documents and were in order; the bid results are as follows:

BIDDER AMOUNT
Brandt Excavating, Inc. $403,488.11
Scanlon Excavating $589,580.00
D Construction, Inc. $667,830.00
Conley Excavating $682,460.00

- Based on the proposals received, we recommend the project be awarded
to the low, responsive, responsible bidder, Brandt Excavating, Inc. in the

amount of $403,488.11 .

Enclosure

REH/am

Project# 9956.00

Peru Office

Ottawa Office
4152 Progress Boulevard « Peru, IL 61354 218 \West Lafayette Street » Ottawa, IL 61350
Phone 815.223.3344 » Fax 815.223.3348 Phone 815.434.7225 & Fax 815.434,2831

peru@chamlin.com

ottawa@chamlin.com

Mendota Office
903 Main Street ¢ Mendota, [L 61342
Phone 815.539.8137 » Fax 815.224,8575
mendota@chamlin.com




VILLAGE OF COAL CITY
CARBON, ELM & SPRING WATER MAIN

Project No. 9956.00
10:00AM, Thursday, January 4, 2024

BID TABULATION
Bidder & Address Total Bid Bid Acknowledge Comments
Security Addenda
Brandt Excavating, Inc. $403,488.11 Bid Bond Yes

385 E. Hoover Street
Morris, IL. 60450

Scanlon Excavating & Concrete, Inc. $589,580.00 Bid Bond Yes
630 8. 7000W Road
Kankakee, IL. 60901

D Construction Ine. $667,830.00 Bid Bond Yes
1488 South Broadway

Coal City, IL 60450

Conley Excavating $682,460.00 Bid Bond Yes

1555 Gramercy Place
Morris, IL. 60450

Opperman Construction Co. No Bid
| 16535 N. 1650 East Road
Pontiac, [I. 61764

PT Ferro Construction No Bid
700 South Rowell Avenue

Joliet, IL 60433

Stott Contracting No Bid

6630 N. Ashton Road
Morris, I, 60450

Superior Excavating No Bid
424 San Carlos Road
Minooka, IL 60447




2023 Total CAD Events

JAN. FEB. MARCH APRIL MAY JUNE JULY AUG. SEPT. OCT. NOV. DEC. TOTALS
CLARK 30 41 29 7 9 3 K 14 10 12 19 9 193
GORON 50 65 54 71 86 58 98 86 92 57 83 77 877
IMHOF 6 5 11 11 28 70 85 83 24 32 36 352
JONES 93 103 92 105 116 112 86 63 120 96 95 66 1147
KASHER 2 38 3 54
LARSON 93 97 125 91 142 85 98 25 173 89 115 93 1226
LOGAN 2 5 2 9
MAZZONE 34 57 73 33 19 216
MCKIM 17 17
MORAN 3 3 4 22 20 26 31 30 13 24 31 3 210
NUGENT 51 66 50 42 43 50 50 24 10 7 8 3 404
ROTH 72 65 103 78 69 120 88 95 128 66 127 77 1088
STADLER 13 76 81 82 57 309
STOCKDELL 68 70 87 84 97 128 73 81 79 31 59 89 996
BUTTERFIELD 16 5 10 17 43
PAQUETTE
POST
ROACH
TOTAL 526 615 638 548 630 654 617 514 725 513 661 544 7186




2023 Calls Requiring a Report

JAN. FEB. MARCH APRIL MAY JUNE JULY AUG. SEPT. 0CT. NOV. DEC. TOTALS
CLARK & 7 11 14 g 5 8 6 1 1 9 & 82
GORON 10 20 23 39 22 16 28 20 21 13 16 228
IMHOF 5 5 11 9 11 22 46 43 8 7 16 23 211
JONES 33 30 33 43 31 29 31 15 48 28 32 6 364
KASHER 2 19 1 22
LARSON 20 46 61 31 35 14 19 25 21 7 26 14 319
LOGAN 2 5 3 10
MAZZONE 25 39 23 33 11 131
MCKIM 5
MORAN 1 2 12 6 12 10 3 13 8 2 69
NUGENT 32 30 23 24 9 19 18 16 2 P 3 178
ROTH 26 21 29 52 19 24 21 22 25 52 22 21 334
STADLER 4 30 12 18 13 77
STOCKDELL 25 16 62 30 25 31 19 27 24 30 19 19 327
BUTTERFIELD 5 3 1 3 12
PAQUETTE
POST 6 2 8
ROACH
TOTAL 203 238 282 278 185 166 202 193 183 165 151 131 2372




2023 Criminal Charges

JAN. FEB. MARCH | APRIL MAY JUNE JULY AUG. SEPT. OCT. NOV, DEC. TOTALS
CLARK 1 1
GORON 6 2 2 3 3 8 4 6 1 1 1 37
IMHOF 1 2 2 2 2 2 11
JONES 5 8 3 7 3 8 2 1 4 4 7 52
LARSON 9 12 10 5 7 3 5 7 11l 3 14 3 94
MAZZONE 1 3 2 6
MCKIM
MORAN 1 1
NUGENT i 2 3
ROTH 4 1 3 1 1 3 13
STADLER 2 2 4 4 12
STOCKDELL 2 2 1 4 2 4 6 5 1 3 3 33
BUTTERFIELD 1 1 2
PAQUETTE
ROACH
TOTAL 23 24 19 17 22 22 27 21 29 13 34 i4 265




2023 Citation Totals

JAN. FEB. MARCH APRIL MAY JUNE JULY AUG. SEPT. OCT. NOV. DEC. TOTALS
CLARK 0
GORON 3 1 4 5 3 7 5 6 3 4 41
IMHOF 2 2 1 2 4 13 1 7 11 9 52
JONES 17 18 17 19 i3 14 13 1 21 11 19 163
LARSON 13 13 12 9 16 8 10 13 14 12 15 7 142
MAZZONE 1 1 6 2 10
MCKIM 4 4
MORAN 2 2
NUGENT 1 1 1 3
ROTH 3 1 4 3 1 2 1 15
STADLER 5 7 6 18
STOCKDELL 6 2 1 3 10 7 11 11 3 6 9 69
BUTTERFIELD 1 1
PAQUETTE
ROACH
TOTAL 43 37 38 36 43 40 43 43 58 38 60 41 520




2023 Traffic Crashes

JAN.

FEB.

MARCH

APRIL

MAY JUNE

JULY

AUG.

SEPT.

OCT.

NOV,

DEC.

TOTALS

CLARK

GORON

IMHOF

17

JONES

=

15

LARSON

N

IR

MAZZONE

MCKIM

[

MORAN

Ui

NUGENT

w

ROTH

STADLER

STOCKDELL

[y

BUTTERFIELD

NiRh{ O

PAQUETTE

POST

ROACH

TOTAL

14

82




2023 D.U.l. Reports

JAN.

FEB.

MARCH

APRIL

MAY

JUNE

JULY

AUG.

SEPT.

OCT.

NOV.

DEC.

TOTALS

CLARK

GORON

IMHOE

JONES

LARSON

MAZZONE

MORAN

NUGENT

ROTH

STADLER

=Y

STOCKDELL

BUTTERFIELD

PAQUETTE

ROACH

TOTAL




2023 Verbal Warnings

JAN. FEB. | MARCH | APRIL MAY JUNE JuLY AUG. SEPT. OCT. NOV. DEC. | TOTALS
CLARK 1 1 1 3
GORON 6 5 39 34 29 39 34 32 13 1 43 275
IMHOF 1 8 22 4 16 2 7.00 ) 3 77
JONES 43 62 50 60 46 31 27 39 41 35 18 452
LARSON 48 36 60 59 46 66 57 62 50 66 62 612
MAZZONE 20 13 4 3 40
MCKIM
MORAN 1 1 2
NUGENT 23 34 15 5 16 13 1 111
ROTH 4 1 1 2 11 1 5 11 13 11 5 65
STADLER 5 10 25 51 32 123
STOCKDELL 15 13 19 24 53 20 18 15 33 27 51 288
BUTTERFIELD 1 1/1/1900
PAQUETTE
ROACH
TOTAL 159 165 189 201 223 174 162 172 183 200 221 2049




2023 P-Tickets

JAN.

FEB.

MARCH

APRIL

MAY

JUNE

JULY

AUG.

SEPT.

OCT.

NOV.

DEC.

TOTALS

CLARK

GORON

IMHOF

JONES

LARSON

NP e N

MAZZONE

MORAN

NUGENT

ROTH

STADLER

STOCKDELL

BUTTERFIELD

PAQUETTE

ROACH

TOTAL

14




